Sk
B b T D RS IR o
I ,hjd, R"hdig.%ﬂ

tATRA ORDINARY
s B A ke
ShDeiciigd DY Ellﬁi,aﬂ@ﬁhgf’

IXXIV Aizawl, Wednesday, 26. 4, 1995, Vaisakha 6, S.E. 1917, Tssue

No. 95

NOTIFICATION

12017/4/94-LID, the 24th April,

1994, The following Act is hereby pub-
or general information,

Rolura Sailo,
Deputy Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram.

THE MOTOR VEHICLES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1994

AN
ACT
further to amend the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Forty-fifth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

. (1) This Act may be called the Motor Vehicles Short title
(Amendment) Act, 1994, and com-

mencement.
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central
overnment may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
appoint; and different dates may be appointed for diffe-
rent provisions of this Act and any reference in an
such provision to the commencement of this Act shall

be construed as a reference to the coming into force of
that provision.




Ex—95/95

59 of 1988.

Amend-
ment of
section J.

Amend-
ment of
section 4.

Amend-
ment of
section 7.

Amend-
ment of
section 8.

2. In section 2 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (here-

inafter referred to as the principal Act),—

(i) in clause (8), sub-clause (a) shall be omitted;

(ii) in clause (21), for the figure “6000”, the figure
“7500” shall be ‘substituted; -

(iii) after clanse (21), the following clause shall be in-
serted, namely:—

‘(21A) “manufacturer” means a person who is engaged
in the manufacture of motor vehicles;’; :

(iv) in clause (28), for the words “thirty-five cubic
centimetres” occuring at the end, th: words “twenty-
five cubic centimetres” shall be substituted;

(v) for clause (39), the following clause shall be substi-
tuted, namely:— ' _

‘(39) “‘semi-trailer” means a vehicle not mechanically
propelled (other than a trailer), which is intended to be
connected to a motor vehicle and which is so constructed
that a portion of it is super-imposed on, and a part of

‘whose weight is borne by, that motor vehicle;’;

(vi) in clauss (42), after sub-clause (iii), the following
sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:—

*“(iv) Zilla Parishad or any other similar local authority.”.

3. In section 3 of the nrincipal Act, in'sub-section (1),
for the words “a motor cab,” the words “a motor cab
or motor cycle’ shall be substituted.

4. In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
in the proviso, for the words “a motor cycle without
gear” the words “‘a motor cycle with engine capacity
not, exceeding 50cc™ shall be substituted.

5. In section 7 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1),
the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) No person shall be granted a learner’s licence to
drive a transport vehicle unless he has held a driving
licence to drive a light motor vehicle for at least one

year,”,

6. In section 8 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(3), the following proviso shall be added, namely:—

T VLTRSS




lere-  Amend-

Jure

in-

i HEGWE. V. NG T

“Provided that no such medical certificate is requi-
red for licence to drive a vehicle other than a transport
vehicle,”. :

7. In section 9 of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substitu.
ted, namely :—

“(3) If the applicant passes such test as may be pres-
cribed by the Central Government, he shall be issued the
driving licence:

Provided that no such test shall be necessary where
the applicant produces procf to show thar—

(a) (i) the applicant has previously held a driving licence
to drive such class of vehicle and that the period bet-
ween the date of expiry of that licence and the date of
the application does not exceed five years, or

(ii) the applicant holds or has previously held a driving
licence to drive such class of vehicle issued under section
18, or

(iii) the applicant holds a driving licence to drive such
class of vehicle issued by a competent authority of any
country outside India, subject to the condition that the
applicant complies with the provisions of sub-section (3)
of section 8, :

(b]?l the applicant is not suffering from any disability
which is likely to cause the driving by him to be a source
of danger to the public; and the licensing authority may,
for that purpose, require the applicant to produce a me-
dical certificate in the same form and in the same man-
ner as is referred to in sub-section (3) of section 8:

Provided further that where the application is for a
driving licence to drive a motor vehicle (not being a
transport vehicle), the licensing authority may exempt
the applicant from the test of competence to drive a ve-
hicle prescribed under this sub-section, if the applicant
possesses a driving certificate issued by any institution
recognised in this behalf by the State Government.”;

(b) for sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely:--

“(5) Where the applicant does not pass the test, he may
be permitted to re-appear for the test after a period of
seven days:

LR B HE T e )

Ex—95/95



Amend-
ment of

section 26.

Amend-
ment of

section 41.

Amend-
ment of

section 43,

4

Provided that where the applicant does not pass the
test even after three appearances, he shall not be quali-
fied to re-appear for such test before the expiry of a pe-
riod of sixty days from the date of last such test.”.

8. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2)

for clauses (e) to (h), the following clause shall be sub-
stituted, namely:— '

“(e) transport vehicle;”.
9. In section 14 of principal Act, in sub-section (2),—

(i) in sub-clause (a), the word ‘““and” shall be omitted,
and after clause (a) as so amended, the following pro-
viso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that in the case of licence to drive a
transport vehicle carrying goods of dangerous or hazar-
dous nature be effective for a period of one year and
renewal thereof shall be subject to the condition that the

driver undergoes one day refresher course of the pres-
cribed syllabus; and”;

(ii) in clause (b),—

(@) in sub-clause (i), for the words “forty years,” at
the two places where they occur, the words “fifty years”
shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-clause (ii), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(ii) if the person referred to in sub-clause (i), has
attained the age of fifty years on the date of issue or
as the case may be, renewdl thereof, be effective, on
payment of such fee as may be prescribed, for a period
of five years from the date of such issue or renewal S

10. In section 26 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(2), for the words “printed copy”, the words “printed
copy or copy in such other form as the Central Gevern-
ment may require” shall be substituted.

11. In section 41 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(14), for the words “original registering authority”, the
words “last registering authority” shall be substituted.

12. In section 43 of the principal Act,—

Amend-
ment of &
section 10




? §
ment of
section 14

NTBU, V. N T

(a) in the proviso to sub-section (2), for the words
“with a body”, the words “with a body or any unfore-
seen circumstances beyond the control of the owner”
shall be substituted;

(b) . after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall
be inserted, namely:—

“(3) In a case where the motor vehicle is held under
irepurchase agreement, lease or hypothecation, the re-
gistering authority or other prescribed authority shall
issue a temporary certificate of registration of such vehi-
cle, which shall incorporate legibly and prominently the
full name and address of the person with whom such

agreement has been entered into by the owner.”,

13. In section 48 of thé principal Act, after sub-section
(5), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(6) The owner of the vehicle shall also inform at the
earliest, in writing, the registering authority about the
theft of bis vehicle together, with the name of the police
station -where the theft report was lodged, and the re-
gistering authority shall take into account such report
while disposing of any application for no objection cer-
tification, registration, transfer of ownership or issue of
duplicate registration certificate.”.

14, "In section 51 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words “original registering authority”, the
words “last registering authority” shall be substituted ;

(ii) the following shall be added at the end, namely :—

“and an intimation in this regard shall be sent to the
orginal registering authority if the last registering autho-
rity is not the original registering authority”’;

(b) in sub-section (3),—

(i) for the words or ““original registering authority” the

words “last registering authority” shall be substituted ;

(ii) the following shall be added at the end, namely:—
“and an intimation in this behalf shall be sent to the
original registering authority if the last registering autho-
1ity is not the original registering authority”;

T T,

Ex—95/95



Ex—95/95 6

(c) in sub-section (5), after the words ““taken possession
of the vehicle”, the words *from the registered owner”’
shall be inserted;

(d) _in sub-section (6), for the words and f igures “‘under
section 47, make an application”, the words and figures
“under section 47, or removal of the vehicle to another
State, or at the time of conversion of the vehicle
from one class to another, or for issue of no objection
certificate under section 48, or for change of residence
or place of business under section 49, or for the altera-
tion of the vehicle under section 52, make an applica-
tion” shall be substituted ;

(¢) in sub-section (10), after the word ‘“‘communicate’’
the words “by registered post acknowledgement due”,
shall be inserted;

(f) for sub-section (II), the following sub-sections shall
be substituted, namely :—

“(II) A registering authority registering the new vehicle,
or issuing the duplicate Certificate of registration, or
a no objection certificate or a temporary certificate of
registration, or issuing or renewing, a fitness certificate
or substituting entries relating to another motor vehicle
in the permit, shall intimate the financier of such
transaction.

(12) The registering authority where it is not the origi-
nal registering authority, when making entry under sub-
section (1) or sub-section (2), or cancelliug the said en-
try under sub-section (3) or issuing the fresh certificate
of registration under sub-section (5) shall communicate
the same to the original registering authority.”

15. In section 52 of the principal Act,— Amend-
ment of
section 52,

(1) in sub-section (1) after the proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided further that modification of the engine,
Or any part thereof of a vehicle for facilitating its opera-
tion by a different type of fuel or source of energy in-
cluding battery, compressed natural gas, solar power or
any other fuel or source of energy other than liquid
petroleum gas shall be treated as an alteration but that
shall be subject to such conditions as may be prescribed”;

(ii) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section
and Explanation shall be inserted, namely :(—




1ent of

i

mend- 4

:ction 52, ._:

wevggEY @YWE VAW #Y

“(6) No person holding a vehicle under a hire-purchase
agreement shall make any alteration of the vehicle for
which approval of the registerin_g authority ig required

under sub-section ( 1), except with the written consent
of the registered owner.

Explanation.—For the purposes ot this section, ¢

tion” means a chgmg_e in the structure of a vehicle which
results in change in its basic feature’,

16. In section 56 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(4), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

cribed or where the prescribed authority = does not
hold such technical qualification on the basis of the
report of an officer having such qualifications,”,

17. In section 57 of the principal Act, for sub-section

(1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(1) Any person aggrieved by an order of the regis-
tering authority under section 41, 42, 43, 45, 47, 48, 49,
50, 52, 53, 55 or 56 may, within thirty days of the date
on which he has received notice. of such order, approval
against the order to the prescribed authority,”,

18. 1In section 58 of the principal Act, ‘in sub-section
(1), for the words ““maximum safe laden weight”, the

words  “maximum gross vehicle weight” shall be
substituted.

19. In section 63 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(2), after the words “shall supply to the Central Govern-
ment”, the words “if so desired by it”, shal] be inserted.

20. In section 66 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be
added, namely:—

“Provided that the holder of a permit of any articulated

vehicle may use the prime-m_over of that articulated
vehicle for any other semi-trailor,” ;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for clayse (1), the following
clause shall be substituted, namely :—

Ex—95/95



Ex—95/95 8

“() to any motor vehicle which is operated by eleciric
battery, compressed natural gas or solar energy.”.

Amendment 21, In section 67 of the principal Act, in sub-section §
of section (1), after clause (i), the following proviso shall be 3
67. inserted, namely:—

“Provided that the fares and freights in respect of such
stage carriages, contract carriages and goods carriages |
operated by battery, compressed natural gas or solar 1
energy shall be fixed by the owner or operator;”.
i
22. In section 68 of the principal Act, in sub-section Amend- §
(3), after clause (c), the following clause shall be inser- ment of

ted, namely:— section 68,
“(ca) Government to formulate routes for plying stage

carriages;”’.

23. In section 71 of the principal Act,— Amend-

iy ; ment of
(@) the proviso to sub-section (1) shall be omitted; section 714

g . * : i
(b) in sub-section (3), in the proviso to clause (d),— 3

(i) in clause (ii), the word “or”, occurring at the end,
shall be omitted; :

(i) in clause (iii), the word “or” shall be inserted at
the end, and after clause (iii) as so amended, the fol-
lowing clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iv) any other class or category of persons, as the
State Government may, for reasons to be recorded in
writing, consider necessary.”;

(c) sub-sections (4) and (5) shall be omitted.

‘24. 1In section 75 of the principal Act, in sub-section Amend-
(1), for the words ‘“‘motor cabs to persons desiring ment of
to drive the cabs”, the words “motor cabs or motor section 75
cycles to persons desiring to drive either by themselves

or through drivers, motor cabs or motor cycles” shall

be substituted.

25. In section 80 of the principal Act, for the words Amend-
“Regional Transport Authority”’, wherever they occur, ment of
the words “Regional Transport Authority, State Trans- section 80,
port Authority or any prescribed authority referred to in
sub-section (1) of section 66 shall be substituted.




1

Amend-
ment of 4
section 688

Amend-
ment of &
section 75

Amend- &
ment of §
section 804

¥ Q;,‘
et S !‘.‘!‘ff‘i

O

26. In section 81 of the principal Act, sub-section (1),
for the words “without renewal”, the words “from the
date of issuance or renewal thereof” shall be substituted.

27. In section 88 of the principal Act,—

(a) .in sub-section (8), for the words
permit in relation to a vehicle covered”, . the words
“erant a special permit to any public service vehicle
including any vehicle covered” shall be substituted;

“grant a special

(b) in sub-section (9), for the word and figures “and
897, the words, brackets, letter and figures “clause (d)
of sub-section (1) of section 87 and section 89 shall
be substituted;

(c) sub-section (10) shall be omitted;

(d) in sub-section (12), for the word and figures ‘“and
89”, the words, brackets, letter and figures “clause (d)
of sub-section (1) of section 87 and section 89" shall
be substituted;

(¢) sub-section (13) shall be omitted.

28. In section 89 of the, principal Act, for sub-section
(2), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(2) The State Government shall constitute such num-
ber of Transport Appellate Tribunals as it thinks fit
and each such Tribunal shall consist of a judicial officer
who is not below the rank of a District Judge or who
is qualified to be a Judge of the High Court and it
shall exercise jurisdiction within such area as may be
notified by that Government.”.

29, In section 91 of the principal Act, for sub-section
(1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(1) The hours of work of any person engaged for
operating a transport vehicle shall be such as provided
in the Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961.”.

30. Section 99 of the principal Act shall be re-num-
bered as sub-section (1) thereof and after sub-section
(1) as so re-numbered, the following sub-section shall
be inserted, namely:—

Ex—95/95

Amend-
ment o
Section 81

Amend-
ment of
section 88.

Amend-
ment of
section 89,

27 of 1961,



Ex—95/95

Amendment
of section
109,

Amendment
of section
110.

Amendment
of section
111.

10

“rn

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section
(1) when a proposal is published under that sub-section,
then from the date of publication of such proposal, no
permit shall be granted to any person, except a tempo-
rary permit during the pendency of the proposal and
such temporary permit shall be valid only for a period
of one year from the date of its issue or till the dats
of final publication of the scheme under section 100,
whichever is earlier.”.

31. In section 109 of the principal Act, after sub-
section (2), the following sub-section shall be
inserted, namely: —

“(3) If the Central Government is of the opinion that
it is necessary or expedient so to do in the public inte-
rest, it may by order published in rhe Official Gazette”
notify that any article or process used by a manufacturer
shall conform to such standard as may be specified in
that order,”.

32. In section 110 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for clavse (b), the following clause shall be sub-
stituted, namely;";

““(b) the size, nature, maximum retail price and condi-

tion of tires, including embossing thereon of date and
year of manufacture, and the maximum load carrying
capacity:—

(ii) after clause (m), the following clauses shall be
inseited, namely:—

“(n) installation ol catalytic convertors in the class of
vehicles to be prescribed;

(0) the placement of audio-visual or radio or tape
recorder type of devices in public vehicles;

(p) warranty after sale of vehicle and norms therefor.”.

33. In section 111 of the principal Act, in sub-sec-
tion (2),—

(a) in clause (d), after the words “by prescribed au-
thorities”, the words ‘‘and fees to be charged for such
test’” shall be inserted ;




ndment
ection

FEEQ, NU. NE AL

11

(b) clause (g) shall be omitted.

34. 1In section 113 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(1), for the words “heavy goods vehicles or heavy
passenger motor vehicles”, the words ‘“‘transport vehicle”
shall be substituted.

35. In section 114 of the principal Act, in sub-section

(1), for the words beginning with “any peison authorised”
and ending with the words and figures .‘“‘contravention

of section 1137, the words and figures ‘‘any officer of

the Motor Vehicles Department authorised in this behalf

by the State Government shall, if he has reason to

believe that a goods vehicle or trailor is being used

in contravention of section 113" shall be substituted.

36. In section 116 of the principal Act, in sub-sec—
tion (7), for the words “the Scheduie”, at both  the places
where they occur, the words “the First Schedule” shall
be substituted.

37. In section 127 of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall
be substitute, namely:—

“(1) Where any motor vehicle is abandoned or left
unattended on a public place for ten hours or more or
is parked in a place where parking is legally prohibited,
its removal by a towing service or its immobilisations by
any means including wheel clamping may be authorised
by a police officer in uniform having jurisdiction.”;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the word *“highway”, at both
the places where it occurs, the words “public place”
shall be substituted.

38. In section 129 of the principal Act, for the words
“a protective headgear of such descriptions as may be
specified by the State Government by rules made by it
in this behalf, and different descriptions of headgears
may be specified in such rules in relation to different
circumstances or different class or description of motor
cycles”, the words “protective headgear conforming to
the standards of Bureau of Indian Standards” shall be
substituted.

39. In section 130 of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely:—

Amend-
ment of
section 116.

Amend-
ment of
section 127.

Amend-
ment of
section 129

Amend-
ment of
section 130.




v e R
e e

Ex-95/95

Amend-
ment of
section 132,

Amend-
ment, of
section 134,

5

“(2) The conductor, il any, of a motor vehicle on any
public place shall on demand by any officer of the Motor
Vehicles Department authorised in this behalf, produce
the licence for examination”.;

(b) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section and
Explanation shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The owner of motor vehicle (other than a vehicle
registered under section 60), or in his absence the driver
or other person in charge of the vehicle, shall, on demand
by a registering authority or any other officer of the
Motor Vehicles Department duly authorised in this behalf,
produce the certificate of insurance of the velicle and,
wheie the vehicle is a transport vehicle, also the certifi-
cate of fitness referred to in section 56 and the permit
and il any or all of the certificates or the permit are
not in his possession, he shall, within fifteen days from
the date of demand, submit photo copies of the same,
duly attested in person or send the same by registered
post to the officer who demanded it.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section,
“certificate of insurance” means the certificate issued
under sub-section (3) of section 147.”.

40. 1In section 132 of the principal Act, in sub-sec-
tion (1),—

(@) for the words ‘“‘may reasonable be necessary’’, the
words - “may for such reasonable time as may be neces-

sary, but not exceeding twenty-four hours” shall be
substituted ;

(b) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substi-
tuted namely:—

“(a) when required to do so by any police officer not
below the rank of a Sub-Inspector in uniform, in the
event of the vehicle being involved in the occurence of
an accident to a person, animal or vehicle or of damage
to property, or”;

(c) clause (c) shall be omitted.

41, In section 134 of the principal Act,—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “and if necessary, con-
vey him to the nearest hospital”, the words “by convey-
ing him to the nearest medical practitioner or “hospital,




HOBW, NV, 1B I\

13 Ex—5/95

and it shall be the duty of every registered medical prac-
titioner or the doctor on duty in the hospital imme-
diately to attend to the injured person and render medi-
cal aid or treatment without waiting for any procedural
formalities” shall be substituted;

ir
b

(b) after clause (b), the following clause and Explana-
tion shall be inserted, namely:—

““(c) give the following information in writing to the
insurer, who has issued the certificates of insurance,
atout the occurrence of the accident, namely:—

(i) insurance policy number and period of its validity;
(ii) date, time and place of accident;

(iii) particulars of the persons injured or killed in
the accident; :

{iv) name of the driver and the particulars of his driving
licence.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, the ex-
pression “driver” includes the owner of the vehicle.”

42, 1In section 136, in the proviso, for the words “with-
of out unnecessary delay”, the words “after completion of
ion 136. the formalities to the owner, driver or the person in
charge of the vehicle within twenty-four hours” shall be
substituted.

w1

43. In section 140 of the principal Act,—
A jon 140. (a) in sub-section (2),—

(i) - for the words “‘twenty-five thousand rupees”, the
words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words
“twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be- substituted ;

L - L

(b) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section and
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section
(2) regarding death or bodily injury to any person, for
which the owner of the vehicle is liable to give compen-
sation for relief, he is also liable to pay compensation
under any other law for the time being in force:




Ex—95/95

6 of 1991.

14

Provided that the amount of such compensation to
be given under any other law shall be reduced from

the amount of compensation payable under this section
or under section 163A.”

44, In section 141 of the prircipal Act, in sub-section

. (1), for the words and bracket “any other right (here-

after”, the words, figures, letter and bracket “a-y other
right, except the right to claim under the scheme refer-
red to section 163A (such other right hereafter” shall be
substituted. : :

45, In section 146 of the Princial Act, in sub-section
(1), before the Explanation, the following proviso shall
be Inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in the case of 2 vehicle carrying, or
meant to carry, dangerous or hazardous goods, there
shall also be a policy of insurance under the Public
Liability Insurance Act, 1991.”

46. In section 147 of the principal Act, sub-section (1),
'n clause (b), in sob-clause (i), for the words
“injury to any person,” the words “injury to any person,
including owner of the goods or his authorised represen-
tative carried in the vehicle” shall be substituted.

47. In section 149 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(1), after the brackets and words “(being a liability
covered by the terms of the policy),” the words, figures
and letter “or under the provisions of section 163A”
shall be inserted.

6. 'n section 157 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(1), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:

“Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is
hereby declared that such deemed transfer shall include
transfer of rights and liabilities of the said certificate
of insurance and policy of insurance.”

49. In section 158 of the principal Act, for sub-section
(0), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:

“(6) As soon as any information regarding any
accident involving death or bodily injury to any person
is recorded or report under this section is completed by
a police officer, the officer incharge of the police station

shall forward a copy of the same within thirty days

Amend- 3
ment of %
A

section 418

[ \'
s

-

Amend-
ment of
section
[46.

i

Amend-
ment of &
section [47:8

Amend-
ment of 48
section 149§

Amend- §
—ment  off
section 1578

Amend-
ment of &
section 1582




k.
t of

=1
-

. Amend-

ment of §
section @
146.
: E rtion of
sec-
4 163A
~ Amend- | 163B.
ment of :

section (4]

i
!

Amend-;
ment
section

Amend- |
ment of §
section 158

ion 161,

Kega, No. NBE 9(

15

from the date of recording of information or, as the
case may be, on completion of such ieport to the
Claims Tribunal having jurisdiction and a copy thereof
to the concerned insurer and where a copy is made avai-
lable to the owner, he shall also within thirty days of

receipt of such report, forward the same to such Claims
Tribunal and Insurer.”

50. In section 161 of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3),—

(2) in clause (a), for the words ‘“‘eight thousand and
five hundred rupees,” the words twenty-five thousand
rupees’ shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “two thousand rupees,”
the words “twelve thousand and five hundred rupees”
shall de substituted.

* 51.  After section 163 of the principal Act, the following

sections shall be inserted, namely:

163A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
Act or in any other law for the time being in force
or instrument having the force of law, the owner of
the motor vehicle of the authorised insurer shall be
liable to pay in the case of death or permanent disable-
ment due to accident arising out of the use of motor
vehicle, compensation, as indicated in the ‘Second

Schedule, to the legal heirs or the victim, as the case
may be.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section
“permanent disability’’ shall have the same meaning
and extent as in the Workmen’s Compensation Act, 1923,

(2) In any claim for compensation under sub-section
(1), the claimant shall not be required to pleador establ-
ish that the death or permanent disablement in respect
of which the claim has been made was due to any
wrongful act or neglect or default of the owner of the
vehicle or vehicles concerned or of any other person.

(3) The Central Government may, Kkeeping in view
the cost of living by notification in the Official Gazette,
from time to time amend the Second Schedule.

163B. Where a person is entitled to claim compensation
under section 140 and section 163A, he shall file the

claim under either of the said sections and not
under both.”

Ex-—95/95

8 of 1923,



Fx— 95/95

Amend-
ment of
section 165.

Amend-
ment of
section 166.

16

52. In section 165 of the principal Act,—

(a) insub-section (1), in the Explanation, the words,
figuresdand letter “and section 163A” shall be added at
the end;

(b) in sub-section (3), in clause (c), the words “or as
a District Judge” shall be added at the end.

5_3. In section 166 of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section and
proviso shall be substituted namely:—

“(2) Every application under sub-section (1) shall be
made, at the option of the claimant, either to the Claims
Tribunal having jurisdiction over the area in which the
accident occurred, or to the Claims Tribunal within the
local limits of whose jurisdiction the claimant resides or
carries on business or within the local limits of whose
jurisdiction the defendant resides, and shall be in such
form and contain such particulars as may de prescribed:

Provided that where no claim for compensation
under section 140 is made in such application, the
application shall contain a separate statement to that
effect immediately before the signature of the applicant.”;

(b) sub-section (3) shall be omitted;

(¢) for the sub-section (4), the. following sub-section
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(4) The Claims Tribunal shall treat any report of ac-
cidents forwarded to it under sub-section (6) of section
158 as an application for compensation under this Act.”.

4. After section 182 of the principal Act, the follow-
ing section shall be inserted, namely:—

*“182A. Any person who contravenes the provisions of
sub-section (3) of section 109, shall be punishable with
a fine of one thousand rupees for the first offence, and
with a fine of five thousand rupees for any subsequent
offences.”.

Insertion |
of new sec4
tion 132A4

Punish- 3
ment for 3
offences
relating to}
construc-' |
tion and &
ma intenanc
of vehicles.§




Kegd, No. NE 9(

17 Ex—95/

55. 'In section 185 of tHe principdl Act, for clause (a), Amend-

the following clausé shall be substituted, namely:— ment of
section

“(a) has, in his blood, alcohol exceedifig 30 mg. pet 185.
100 ml. of blood detected in a test by a breath
analyser, or”

36. For section 192 of the principal Act, the following Substitu-
sections sHall be substitutéd, nafie yi— tion of

new sec-

tions for

section 192,

“192. (1) Whoever drives a motor vehicle or causes Using ve-
or allows a motor vehicle to be used in contravention hicle with-
of the provisions of section 39 shall be punishable for out regis-
the first offence with a fine which may extend to five tration.
thousand rupees but shall not be less than two thousand =
rupees for a second or subsequent offence with impri« -
sonment which may extend to one year or with fine

which may extend to ten thousand n'rpeeg but shall not

be less than five thousand rupees or with both: 'k
Provided that the Court may, for réasofis to be re-

corded, impose a lesser punishment. B

(2) Nothing in this section shall apgly to the use of v

a motor vehicle iff an' emergency for thé conveyance of

persons suffering ffom sicknéss or injaries or for the .
transport of food or materials to relieve distress of of 4
medical supplies for a like purpose: i

_ Prévided that the person using the vehicle reports L
about the same to thé Regional Transpott Authotity
within seven days from the date of such use.

(3) The court to which an appeal lies from any convice

tion in respect of an offence of the nature specified in :

sub-section (1), may set aside or vary any order made L
by the court below, notwithstanding that no appeal lies ,
against the conviction in connection with which such

ordér was made.

192A. () Whoever drives & motor vehicle or causes
or allows a motor vehicle to bé used in contravéention
of the provisions of sub-section (1) of section 66 or in
contravention of any condition of @ pérmit relating to
the route on which or the area in which or the purpose
for which the vehicle may be used, shall bé punishable
for the first offence with a fine which may extend to
five thousand rupees but shall not be less than two



Ex—95/95 18

thousand rupees and for any subscquent offunce +ith
imprisonment which rmay extend to one year but shall
not be less than three months or with fine which may
extend to ten thousand rupees but shall not be less
than five thousand rupees or with both:

Providzd that the court may for reasons to be re-
rded, imyosz 2 lesser punishment. :

(2) Nothing in this section shall apply to the use of a
motor vehicle in an emergency fior the conveyance
of persons suffering from sickness or injury or for tas
transport of materials for repair or for the transport of
fyod or materials to relieve distress or of medical sup-
nlies for a like purposc:

Provided tha person using the vehicle reports
about the same to the Regional Transport. Authority
within seven days from the date of such use.

(3) The court to which an appeal lies from any con-
viction in respect of an offence of the hature specified
in sub-section (1), may set aside or vary any order
made by the court below, notwithstanding that no
appeal lies against the conviction in connection with
whizh such order was made.”.

Amendment 57. In section 194 of the principal Act, for sub-section
of section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
194. namely :—

“(1) Whoever drives a motor vehicle or causes or
allows a motor vehicle to be driven in contravention
of tie provisions of section 113 or section 114 or sec-
tion 115 shall be punishable with minimum fine of two
thousand rupees and additional amount of one¢ thousand
rupees per tonne of excess load, together with the
ilabéligy to pay charges for off-loading of the excess
oad.”.

Amendment 58. In section 200 of the principal Act, in sub-section
of section (1), for the word and figures “section 18997, the words,

200. figures and brackets ‘“‘section 189, sub-section (2) of o
section 190” shall be substituted. o
59. In section 201 of the principal Act,— Amend-"!

) ment of
(a) in sub-section (1), after the proviso, the following section 201,
proviso shall be inserted, namely:— {




i BAJETLE

19

“Provided further that where the vehicle is removed
by a Government agency, towing charges sh:all be reco-
vered from the vehicle owner or person in-charge of
such vehicle.”;

(b) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely:— '

“(2) Penalties or towing charges under this section shall
be 1ecovered by such officer or authority as the State
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
authorise.”,

60. In section 202 of the principal Act, for sub-section
(2), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:

“2) A police officer in uniform ‘nay arrest without
warrant any péerson, who has committed an offence under
this Act, if such person, refuses to give his name and
address.”.

61. In section 203 of the principal Act, for sub-section
(1), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) A police officer in uniform or an officer of the
Motor Vehicles Department, as may be authorised in
this behalf by that Department, may require any person
driving or attempting to drive a motor vehicle in a public
place to provide one or more specimens of breath for
breath test there or nearby, if such police officer or
officer has any' reasonable cause to suspect him of having
corumitted an offence under section 185:

Provided that requirement for breath test shall be
made (unless it is made) as soon as reasonably practic-
able after the commission of such offence.”.

62. In section 212 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(4), after the words, brackets and figures “‘sub-section
(1) of section 112", the words, brackets, figures and
letter ““sub:section (4) of section 163A”’ shall be inserted.

63. The Schedule to the principal Act shall be numbered
as the First Schedule thereof.

64. Aftér the First Schedule, as so numbered, the
following Schedule shall be inserted, namely:—

Ex—95/95

Amend-
ment of
section
202.

Amend-
ment of
section 203,

Amend-
ment of
section 212.

Amend-
ment of the
Schedule,

Insertion of
new Sche-
dule.

Ne¢

low
th
er



THE SECOND SCHEDULE
(See Section 163A)

SCHEDULE FOR COMPENSATION FOR THIRD PARTY FATAL ACCIDENTS/INJURY CASES CLAIMS

1.

Fatal Accident :

———

Annual Income

Rs.

Rs.

Rs,

Rs.

Rs.

Rs. Rs. Rs.

Rs.

Rs.

Rs. Rs.
3000 4200 5400 6600 7800 9000 1020011400 12000 18000 24000 36000 40000

Rs.

AGE OF VICTIM MULTIPLIER RUPEES IN THOUSANDS
Campensation in case of death

Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs. Rs
Up to 15 yrs. 15 60 84 108 132 156 180 204 228 240 360 480 720 800
Above 15 yrs. but not exdg. 20 yrs. 16 57 79.8 102 125.4 148.2 171 193.8 216.6 228 342 456 684 760
Above 20 yrs. but not exdg. 25 yrs. 17 54 75.6 97.2 118.8 140.4 162 183.6 2052 216 324 432 648 720
Above 25 yrs. but not exdg. 30 yrs. 18 51 71.4 91.8 112.2 132.6 153 173.4 193.8 204 306 408 612 630
Above 30 yrs. but not exdg. 35 yrs. 17 50 672 86.4 105.6 1248 144 163.2 1924 192 288 384 576 640
Above 35 yrs. but not exdg. 40 yrs. 16 50 63 8l 99 117 135 153 171 180 270 360 540 600
Above 40 yrs. but not exdg. 45 yrs. 15 50 58.8 756 92.4 109.2 126 1428 159.6 168 252 336 504 560
Above 45 yrs. but not exdg. 50 yrs. 13 50 50.4 64.8 79.2 936 108 1224 136.8 144 216 286 432 430
Above 50 yrs. but not exdg. 55 yrs. 11 50 50 54 66 78 90 102 114 120 180 240 360 400
Above 55 yrs. but not exdg. 60 yrs. 8 50 50 50 528 624 72 81.6 91.2 96 144 192 286 320
Above 60 yrs. but not exdg. 65 yrs. 5 50 50 50 50 50 54 612 634 72 108 144 216 240
5 50 .-58 50 50 51 57 60 90 120 180 200

Above 65 yrs.

50 50

NOTE : The amount of compensation so arrived at in the case O
1/3rd in consideration of the expenses which the victim would have
he been alive.

f fatal accident claims shall be reduced by
incurred towards maintaining himself had




(VE9T uonodag 23g)

HTNAdHOS ANODFS FHL

21

Ex—95/95
Amount of compensation shall not be less than Rs. 50,000.
General Damage (in case of death):
| The following General Damages shall be payable in addition
to compensations outlined above:
(i) Funeral expenses — Rs. 2,000/~
(i) Loss of Consortium, if beneficiary is the spouse — Rs. 5,000/-
(iii) Loss of Estate i — Rs.  2,500/-

(iv) Medical Expenses-actual expenses incurred before
death supported by bills/vouchers but not exceeding — Rs. 15,000/

eneral Damages in case of injuries and Disabilities :
(i) Pain and Sufferings .
(a) Grievous injuries — Rs.  5,000/-
(b) Non-grievous injuries — Rs. 1,000/~

(i) Medical Expenses-actual expenses incurred sup-
ported by bills/vouchers but not exceeding as one
time payment : — Rs. 15,000/~

‘Disability in non-fatal accidents:

following compensation shall be payable in case of disa-
bility to the victim arising out of non-fatal accidents:

ss of income, if any, for actual period of disablement not
ceeding fifty-two weeks.

LUS either of the following :—

- (@) In case of fermanent total disablement the amount ayable shall be
arrived at by multiplying the annual loss of income by the ultiplier appli-
cable to the age on the date of determining the compensation, or

(b) In case of permanent partial disablement such percentage of compen-
sation which would have been payable in the case of permanent total disable-
ment ds specified under item (a) above.

Injuries deemed to result in Permanent Total Disablement/Permanent Partial

blement and percentage of loss of earning capacity shall be as per Schedule I
r Workmen’s Compensation Act, 1923.

e

I

ael

Yih

tvi

ral

19
(1




Ex—95/95 22 E

' 6. National income for compensation to those who had no in-
come prior to accident :— 4
Fatal and disability in non-fatal accidents :— -

(a) Non-earning persons i R 15,000/_—p.a'.
(b) Spouse —Rs. 1/3rd of income
of the earning surviving

spouse
Iin case of other injuries only “General Damage” as :
applicable.

1
i

‘

¢

Published & Issued by the Controller, Printing & Stationery, Mizoram 1
Printed at the Mizoram Govt. Press, Aizawl Copies 800 !






