Regd. No N. E. 207

The Mizoram Gazette

EXTRA ORDINARY
Published by Authority

Vol. V. Aizawl, Tuesday 16th November 1976, Kartika 25, S.E. 1898, Issue No. 43

i

NOTIFICATION

No. MAS. 4/76/38, -the 15th Nov. 1976. Under Rule 76 of the Rules of Pro-
cedure and Conduct of Business in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly, the follo.
wing Bill which was introduced in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly on the

12th November, 1976, is published together with Statement of Objects and Rea-
sons for general information -

Bill No. 7 of 1976

THE MIZORAM (PROFESSIONS, TRADES, CALLINGS AND
EMPLOYMENTS TAXATION) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1976.

(As introduced in Mizoram Legislati've' Assembly)

A
BILL

to amend the Mizo District (Professions, Trades, Callings and Em-

ployments Taxation) Regulation, 1963 (hereinafter called the Princi-
pal Regulation).

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Mizoram in the
Twenty-seventh Year of the Republic of Tadia as follows :—

Short title, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram -(Professions, Trades,

extent and Callings and Employments Taxation) (Amendment) Act,
commence- 1976.
ment,

(2) It shall have the like extent as the Principal Regulation,

(3) 1t shall be deemed to have come int> force on the Firs
~ day of April, 1976.



2

Substitution 2. Ia section | of the Principal Regulation, for sub-section (2), the

of new sub- following sub-section shali be substituted, namely—

section for

sub-section “(2) It shall extend to the whole of Union Territory
(2: of section of Mizoram excluding the areas of Pawi, Lakher and
1 of the Prin- Chakma Autonomous District Councils in Chhimtuipui
cipal Regulation, District ”

Substitution 3. For the Schedule to the Mizo District (Professions, Trades,
of new Callings and Employments Taxation) Regulation, 1963, the
Schedule for following Schedule shall be substituted, pamely i—-

the Schedule

to the Regu-

lation of 1963.

“THE SCHEDULE
(See Section 4)

A Ia the case of _cVefy person other than a Hindu
undivided or joiut family where the total gross

income :—
Amount of Tax
1. does not exceed Rs. 6,000/ _ Nil
2 exceeds Rs. 6,000/~ but does mot exceed Rs. 10000/- Rs. 3000
3. exceeds Rs. 10,000/- but does not «xceed Rs. 15,000/ Rs. 5000
4 exceeds Rs. 15,000/- but does 1ot exceed Rs 20,000/ Rs. 75-00
5. (xceeds Rs. 20,000/- but does not exceed Rs, 25,000/ Rs. 10000
6. exceeds Rs. 25,000/- but does not exceed Rs. 30,000/ Rs 15000
7. ex eeds Rs. 30,000/- but does not exceed Rs 33,000/ Rs. 200-00
8. excecds Rs. 35,000/ Rs. 250 00
B. In the case of every Hindu undivided or joint
family where the total gross income :—
1. does not exceed Rs. 10,000/- _ Nil
2. exceeds Rs. 10,000/- but does not exceed Rs. 15,000/- Rs. 60°00
3. exceeds -Rs. 15,000/- but does not exceed Rs. 20,000/- Rs. 8000
4. exceeds Rs. 20,000/~ but does not exceed Rs. 25,000/- - Rs. 100:00
5. exceeds Rs. 25,000/~ but does not exceed Rs. 30,000/- Rs. 150:00
6. exceeds Rs. 30,000/~ but does not exceed Rs. 35,000/- Rs. 200°00
7. exceeds Rs. 35,000/ Rs. 250007

STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS

The cxemption limit of taxable income of every Hindu of Joint family and
a person other than a Hindu undivided or Joint family is considered too low



3

at present where the income of the people in terms ot? money has gonsiderably
increased with rise in prices and reducing the purchasing power. This has .ai.Tec-
ted the poorer sections of the people adyqrsely as many hgwe become eligible
now to pay the tax otherwise than the spirit of the Regulation.

The Principal Regulation of 1963 was applicable to the whole of erst}vhi.le
Autonomous Mizo District. With the formation of the three Autonomous District
Councils namely, Pawi, Lakher a1d Cnakma, it 15 intended to exclud.e t.he areas
from the purview of the Principal Regulation as these ‘Autonomous District Coun~
cils are competent to make such laws under the provisions of Paragraph 8 of
the Sixth Schedule to the Constitution of India. The Bill seeks to exclude those
areas by amending the extent clause of the Principal Regulation.

Hence the Bill.

R. Thangliana
Minister-in-charge,
Revenue Department,
Government of Mizoram.

D.C. Pande,
Secretary,

Legislative Assembly Mizoram

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Approximately 5000 income earners of low income group will get exemption
by this proposed amendment and there will be an approximats short reaslisation
of Rs. 1. 20 lakhs as Professional tax per anaum.

X X X

No. MAS. 4/76/38, the 15th Nov., 1976. Under Rule 76 of the Rules of Pro-
cedure and Conduct of Business in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly, the

following Bill which was introduced in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly on the

12th November, 1976, is published together with Statement of Objects and Rea-
sons for general informatioun :-
Bill No 9 of 1976

THE MIZORAM URBAN AREAS RENT CONTROL (AMENDMENT)
BILL, 1976

(As introduce in Mizoram Legislative Assembly)

A
BILL

further to ament the Mizoram Urban Areas Rent Controi Act, 1974
(hereinafter called the Principal Act),




4

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Mizoram in the
Twenty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows

Short tit'e, 1. (Iy This Act may be called the Mizoram Urban Areas Rent

extent and Control (Amendment) Act, 1976.
coOominence- (2) It shall have the like extent as the Principal Act.
ment.

(3) It shall come into force at once.

Amendment 2. In section 1 of the Principal Act. for sub-section

of section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted and shall be
1 of the deemed always to have been substituted.

Principal Act.

“(3). It shall come into force at once”.

Amendment 3. (1) 1In section 2 of the Principal Act, in clause

of sections -+ {e), for the words “market price of the land” appearing in
2 and 3 of between the word *‘the” and “together” the words <price
the Principai of the land as may be fixed by the Revenue Department”
Act. shall be substituted.

(2) In section 3+of the Principal Act, in sub-section
{3), for the woids “market price of the land” appearing in
between the word “the” and *and” the words” price of

the Jand as may be fixed by the Revenue Department”
shail be substituted.

(3) In section 3 of the Principal Act, in proviso io sub-section
(3), for the v.ords “marnet price of land” appearing in be-
tween the word ““‘the” ard “and” the words “price of the

land as may be fixed by the Revenue Department’ shall be
substituted.

{4) In section 3 of the Principal Act, in proviso to sub-section
(3). the word “market” appearing in between the word “-of”
and *“value” shall be deleted.

STATEMENT OF OBIJECTS & REASONS

I. The Mizoram Urban Areas Rent Coutrol Act, 1974 which was passed by the
Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the year 1974 had been assented to by the Lt
Governor on 26.11.1974. Section 1 (3) of the said Act provides that it shali be
deemed to have come into force on such date as may be notified by the Admi-
nistrator in the Official Gazettc. It was the intention of this Government to en-
force the Act with effect from 26.11.1974.  Accordingly, a Notification was issued



5

.

by the Government on 5th March, 1975 bringing into force the said Act from
26-11-1974.  After careful cxammatzon, this notification is found legally nottenable
“as it has a Tetrospective effect. Government of  Indid was consulted - ‘in the
matter _and  after careful consxderatmn in consultation” with the Miais~
try of law & Juctice, it has been suggested that Section 1 (3) of the said

~Act may saitably be amended so as to bring the said Act into force with effect -
from 26 11 19?4

2. Standard rent ls calcu]ated on the ba51s of estlmate cost of the “construction”
and the ‘‘market price” of the land. It is not possible to” ¢alculate market price
of the land accurately as there is no registration or any other document on the
basis of which one can arrive at correct assessmeat of the land value. Presently
it is being calculated “and fixed on' the basis of presamption, Such. presumetive
calculation has sometimes been found unreasonable and the-assessing authority is
also not very sure about the correctness of such assessment. To  avoid such
complications it is felt necessary that all lands in the Urban Areas may be clas~

sified according to the situation and démand. The prrce may be ﬁxed by the
Revenue Department for all the classified lands. : _

Hence this Bill.
foe ot Ch, ,,Chhunga
o Mlmster-m-charge,
General Adminfstration Department,

“D.C. Pande
“Secretary
-*‘Legislative_ Assembly
Mizoram

FINANCIAL MEMORANDU‘VI

:The Mlzoram U;ban Areas Rent Control Act, 1974 recelved the asserit on -
26-11-1974, Section 1 (3) of the said Act prov1des that it shall be deemed to
have come into. force on such .date as may be notified by the Administrator in
the Official Gezette,. It was the intention . f this Government to enforce the Act
with effect from 26.11.1974. Accordingly a Notlﬁcation was issued by the Govern-
ment on 5th March, 1975 bringing into force the said Act from 26-11-1974.
Because of certain :legal anpmalies the provisions of the said Act could not be
operated upon. The preseat Bill seeks to remove those: anomalies. Introduction
of this amendment Bill, does not, involve any extra additional expenditure, over
and above the  expenditure already antlclpated at the time of mtroducnon of
Principal Act in 1974, iy _ e

B



6

No, IMASa 4/76/38, the 15th Nov. 1976, Under Rule 76 of the Rules of Proce-
dufe and Conduct of Business in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly, the following
Bill which was introduced in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly on the 12th

November,
for senml'

Short title
and c¢ome-
mencement.

Amend-

1976, ls published together with Statoment of Objects and Reasons
information t=-

Bili No. & of 1976,

THE MIZORAM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MEMBERS OF
THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1976,

(As introduced in Mizoram Legislative Assembly)

A Bill to amend the Mizoram Salaries and Allc-

wlva‘;l:.l;es of Members of the Legisiative Assembly Act,
973.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assemibly of Mi-

zotam tn the Twenty-seventh Year of the Republic -of

India as follow :—

1. (1) This Actmay be called the Mizoram Sala-
ries and Alowances of Members of the Legislative
Asserably (Amendment) Act, 1976.

{2) Section 2 of this Act shall be deemed to
have come into force on the Ist day ef November,
1976 and section 3 of this Act shall come into force
at once, _

2. In section 3 of the Mizoram Salaries and Allo-

ment of Sec- wances of Members of the Legislative Assembly Act,

tion 3.

Insertion of

~ new section
8A. _

1973 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),-

(i) for the words “one hundred rupees”, the

words “two hundred rupees” shall be substi«
tuted ; and -

(i) forthe words “twenty-five rupees”, the words
“thirty rupees™ shall be substituted.

3. After section 8 of the principal Act, the fol
lowing section shall be inserted, namely {—

“8A Where telephone facilities are avafe
Telephone. lable at the place declared by a

Member to be his headquarters, he

3 of 1974



5

[

by the Goverament on 5th March, 1975 brmglpg into force the said Act from
26-11-1974. At’ter careful exammatnon, this notification is found legally nottenable
-as i{ has.a- retrospectwe effect.  Governmeat' of India was consulted-in the
- matter . and after careful | consideration in consultation with the Minis-
tiy of law & Juctlce,' it has been suggested that  Section 1 (3) of the said
~ Act may suitably be amended so as to bring the said Act into force with effect -
from 26 11 1974,

2. Standard rent 1s calculated on the basm of estlmate cost of the “construction”
and the “‘market price” of the land. It is not possible to calculate market price

of the land accurately as there is ‘no registration or any other document on the
basis of which one can arrive at correct assessment of the land value. Presently

it is being calculated and fixed on' the basis of presumption. Such. presumetive
calculation has sometimes been found unréasonable and the assessing authority is

also not very sure about the correctness of such assessment. To avoid such
complications it i8 felt necessary that all lands' in the Urban Areas may be clas-

sified according to the situation and démand. The prrce inay be ﬁxed by the
Revenue Department for all the classified lands, _ ,

Hence this Bill.
co T Ch ,,Chhung
. Mlmster-m-char e,
General Adninistration Department

D .C. Pande
, “Secretary
S fLegislative. Assembly
Mizoram

FINANCIAL. MEMORANDUM

“The Mlzoram U;ban Areas Rent Control Act, 1974 recelved the asserit on
26-11-1974, Section 1 (3) of the said Act provides that if shall be deemed to
have come into force on such . date as may be notified by the Administrator in
the Official Gezette.. It was the intention. of thls Government to enforce the Act
with effect from 26.11.1974. Accordmgly a Nonﬁcatlon was issued by the Govern-
ment on 5th March, 1975 bringing into force the said Act from 26-11-1974.
Because of certain :legal anomalies the provisions of the said Act could not be
operated upon. The present Bill secks to remove those- anomalies. Iatroduction
of this amendment Bill, does not, involve any extra additional expenditure, over
and above the  expenditure already antxclpated at the time of mtroduc];mp of
Principal Act in 1974, . : L

P !-.-‘. .




6

No. MAS: 4/76/38, the 15th Nov, 1976, Undor Rule 76 of the Rules of Proce-
dure and Conduct of Business In the Mizoram Legisiative Assembly, the following
Bill -which was Introduced in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly on the 12th
Novemberf 1976, is published togeiher with Statement of Objects end Reasons

Bill No, 8 of 1976,

THE MIZORAM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MEMBERS OF
THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1976,

for general information -

(As introduced in Mizoram Legislative Assembly)

A Bill to amend the Mizoram Salaries and Allo-

?ga'?fes of Members of the Legislative Assembly Act,

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Mi-
zotam in the Twenty-seventh Year of the Republic -of
India as follow :—

Short title 1. (1) This Actmay be called the Mizoram Sala-
and com- ries and Allowances of Members of the Legislative
mencement. Assembly (Amendment) Act, 1976.

{2) Section 2 of this Act shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of November,
1976 and section 3 of this Act shall come into force

at once.
Amend. 2. 1In section 3 of the Mizoram Salaries and Allo-
ment of Sec- wances of Members of the Legislative Assembly Act,
tion 3. 1973 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),-

(i) for the words “one bundred rupees”’, the

words “two hundred rupees” shall be substi-
tuted ; and

(i) forthe words “twenty-five rupees”, the words
“thirty rupees” shall be substituted.

Tasertion of 3, After section 8 of the principal Act, the fol.
rsxgw section lowing section shall be inserted, namely :—

“8A Where telephone facilities are aval-
Telephone. lable at the place declared by a
Member to be his headquarters, he

3 of 1974



7

shall be entitled to have & tele-
phone at his residence, or at the
lace where he ordinarily con-
ucts his works relating to the As-
sembly, subject to the coaditions
that he shall meet the oost of ins-
tallation of such telephone in full
and that, in regard to the recur-
ring charges, the liability of the
Government shall be {imited to the
reimbursement of rental charges
for that telephone and changes ia
respect of & maximum of seven
hundred and fifty local calls made
from that telephoneper quarter ins
cluding calls, if any, permitted
free of charge”.

STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS

Rs. 43,000/~
from 1-11-19

In view of the phenomenal rise in the cost of propulsion and maintenance
of motor vehicles and with a view to facilitate the M.L. As to be able to move
about all over Mizoram for keeping in touch with the people, and of the pre-
vailing circumstances in Mizoram, it is felt necessary to raise the Conveyance Al
lowances and the rate of the Daily Ailowances admissible per month, ~ Again con-
sidering the importance of functions of the M.L.As and the need for them to
be able to communicate casily and quickly in the interest of the people, it is felt
necessary to provide Telephone Connection to their residence in their declared
headquarters at such places in Mizoram where telephone facilities exist.

Hence the Bill.

LALSANGZUALA
Minister ln-charge

D.C. Pande

Secretary

Legislative Assembly,
FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Mizoram

The 'proposed enactment will involve an additional recurring expenditure of
Rupees fourty-three thousand) (Approximately) annually with effect
6 out of the consolidated fund of Mizoram; provision for which

will be made in the Budget in due course.

Lalsangzuala

Minister-in-Charge.

Printed a: the Mizoram Govt.' Press, Alzawl C—800



