
The Mizoram Gazette
EXTRA ORDINARY

Published by Authority
RNI No. 27009/1973 Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008
VOL - XLVIII     Aizawl,    Monday  9.12.2019    Agrahayana  18,     S.E.  1941,     Issue No. 827

NOTIFICATION

No. H. 12018/86/2011-LJD/27, the 9 th December, 2019. The following Act is hereby published for
general information.

“The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances of Minister (Amendment) Act, 2019

(Act No. 19 of 2019)
(Received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram on 27.11.2019)

Secretary,
Law & Judicial Deptt.,

Govt. of Mizoram.

THE MIZORAM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTER (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019

AN
ACT

further to amend the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 1999.

Be it enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the Seventieth year of the Republic of India as
follows:

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of
commencement Minister (Amendment) Act, 2019.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2019.

Amendment of 2. In the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 1999 (hereinafter
section 3- referred to as the Principal Act) in section 3, for the words “forty thousand”

the words “eighty thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 3. In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words  “ten thousand rupees”
Section 4 - the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



- 2 -Ex-827/2019

Amendment of 4. In section 5 of the Principal Act, for the words “to the Chief Minister Family
Section 5 - allowances of ten thousand rupees, to the Minister eight thousand rupees

and to the Minister of State five thousand rupees per mensem. An
Entertainment allowance of rupees ten thousand to the Chief Minister, rupees
five thousand to the Minister and rupees three thousand to the Minister of
State per mensem.” the words “to the Chief Minister Family allowance of
twenty seven thousand rupees, to the Minister eighteen thousand rupees
and to the Minister of State fifteen thousand rupees per mensem. An
Entertainment allowance of rupees twenty five thousand to the Chief
Minister, rupees eighteen thousand to the Minister and rupees ten thousand
to the Minister of State per mensem” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 5. In Section 6 of the Principal Act, for the words “ten thousand” the words
Section 6 - “twelve thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of In para 1 of the Schedule of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
Schedule rupees outside Mizoram, and seven hundred fifty within Mizoram

respectively” the words “two thousand rupees outside Mizoram and one
thousand rupees within Mizoram” shall be substituted.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press,  Aizawl.   C/200


