
-,

The,Mlzoram Gazette
EXTRA ORDINARY

Publ\ished by Authority
REGN. NO. NE-313 (MZ)

Vol. XXXI Aizawl Wednesday 23. 1. 2002, Magha 3, S.E. 1923 Issue No. 38

NOTIFICATION

No.H.l2017/55/200l-LJD/2, the 17th January, 2002. The following Central Ac~
are hereby Published for General information.

R.Lalthazuala;
Deputy Secretary to the Govt, of Mizoram,

Law and Judicial Department.

THE SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS OF PARLIA.
MENT tAMENDMENT) ACT, 2001.

AN
ACT

further to amend the Salary, Allowances and Pension of
Members of Parliament Act, 1954.

It is enacted by Parliament in the Fifty-second Year
of the Republic of India as follows.-

1. This Act may be called the Salary, Allowances and Short title.
Pension of Members of Parliament {Amendment) Act,
2001.

2. In section 3 of the Salary, Allowances and Pension
30-of 1954. of Members of Parliament Act, 1954 hereinafter referred

- ··,----tP:;M:.!h'fiw~,cipal~c,t.J" aftei,th"'~, provi,so, the following-
provisos. 'ball be~erted. namely:.. ,,

Amend-
ment of
section 3. .. .



Ex--38/2002

Provided further that in the case of salary, the
provisions of this section shall have effect as if for the
words "four thousand rupees", the words "twelve thou
sand rupees" had been substituted for a period of five
years beginning from the date of commencement of the
Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members of Parlia
ment \Amendment) Act,20JI:

Amend
ment of
section 4.

Amend
ment of
section 8A.

( .• .1.",

Provided also that in the case of the allowance,
the provisions of this section shall have effect as if
for the. words "four hundred rupees," the words "five
hundred rupees" had been substituted for a period of
five years beginning from the date of commencement
of the Salary, AIlowances and Pension of Members of
Parliament (Amendment) Act, 2001.'.

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section
0\ in clause (c: in s1:lb-¢]ause~ii), for the words
"six rupees per kilometre," the words "eight rupees
per kilometre" shall be substituted.

4. In section 8A of the principal Act, in sub
section (1),-,

tal for the words two thousand and five hund
red rupees", the words "three thousand rupees" shall
be substituted;

'b) in the first proviso, for the words five hund
red rupees", the words "six hundred rupees" shall be
substituted.

.f'tl~d aDd laue(} by tbe Omtroder, Pant.mg I St;ationery, MizDda
Printed at the Mizotam (Mot. PreIa'. l\izawt. 8-700 .

•


