The Mizoram Gazette

EXTRA ORDINARY
Publnshed by Authority

REGN. NO. NE--313 (M2)

Vol. XXXI1 Aizawl, Wednesday, 1. 10. 2003, Asvina 9, S.E. 1925, Issue No. 277

NOTIFICATION

No.H.12017/55/2003-LJD/126, the Z4th September, 2003. The following Central
Ordinance is hereby published for general information.

R .Lalthazuala,
Deputy Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram.
MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)
New Delhi, dated the 8th September, 2003/Bhadra 17, 1925 (Saka)
THE TAXATION LAWS (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2003
No. 2 OF 2003
Promulgated by the President in the Fifty-fourth Year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Income-tax Act, 1961, the Wealth-tax Act,
1957 and the Expenditure-tax Act, 1987.

WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President is satisfied

that circumstances exist which render it nx.cessary for him 10 take immediate
action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article
123 of the Constitution, the President is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:—



Ex—277/2003

2
CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

(1) This Ordinance may be called the Taxation

Laws (Amcndment) Ordinance, 2003.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Ordinance,
it shall come into torce ai once.

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS TO THE INCOME-TAX AC1, 1961

-- 43.of 1961 2.
T after refeired to as the Income-tax Act), in ciause

In section 10 of the Income-tax Act, 1961 (herein-

(1 5)9—

(A) after sub-clauss (iiia), the following snb-clause

shall be inserted and shall be decmud to have been

inseried with c¢ffcct from the ist day of Apri, 2001,
~namely:i—

“(ilib) interest payable to the Nordic Invesiment
Bank, being a multilsteral finencial ins i1ution
constituted by the Goveruments ot Denmar.., Fin-
land, Iceland, Norway and Sweden, o 2 ioan
advauced by it to a project approved by the Cen-
tral Goverameiit in terms of the Memorandum of
Understandirng entered into by the Central Govern-
ment with that Bank on the 25th day of Novem-
ber, 1986,”;

(B) in sub-clause (iv),—

“(a) in item (c), the existing Explanation shail be

numbered, as Explanation 1 thereof and after Ex-
pl-navon 1 as so numbered, the following Lipla-
-nation shail be inscited and shall be deciued to
have ‘becn insertee with effect from the ist day

ot April, 1962, namely :—

“Explanation 2.— For the removal of doubts, it is
hereby declared that the usance interest poyable
outside lndia by an undertaking ergagec in the
business ot ship-breakinug in respect of purciase of
a ship from outside li.dia shall be deemed to be
the intcrest payable on a debt incurrcd in a fo-
reign country in respect of the purchase outside
India;”;

Short title
and com-
mence-
ment.

Amend-
meant of
section 10.



3 Ex—277/2003

(b) in the Explanation 1 occuring below item (i),
after clause d), the following clause shall be
inserted aud shall be deemed to have been
inserted with effect from the Ist day of April,
1991, namely:—

“(da) the business of ship-breaking; or”.
Insertion of 3. After section 10B of the Income tax Act, the fol-

new sec- lowiig section shall be insertcd with effcct from the
tion 10BA. 1st day of April, 2004, namcly:—

Special pro- ‘10BA. (1) Subject to the provisions of this see-
visions in tion, a deduction of such profits and gaius as are
respect of derived by a. undcrtaking from the export out of
export of India of eligble articles or things, shall be al-
certain arti- lowed from the total income of the assessee:

cles or

things. Provided that wherein computing the total

income of the undertaking for any assessment year
deduction under section 10A or section 10B has
been claimed, the uandertaking shall not be entitled
to tae deduction uader this section:

Provided further that no deduction under this
section shall be aliowed to any undertaking for
assessment year beginning on the st dey of April,
2010 and subsequcut years.

(2) This section applies to any undertaking which
fulfils the followiug conditions, namely:—

(a) it manufactures or produces the eligible
articles or things without the use of imported
raw matcrials;

(b) it is not formed by the splitting up, or
the reconstruction, of a busincss aiready in
existence:

Provided that this condition shall not apply
in respect of any undertaking which is formed as
a result of the re-establishment, reconstiuction or
revival by the asscssee of the business ot any
such undertaking as is reterred to in section 33B,
in the circumtances and within the period specified
In that section;

(c) it is mot formed by the tra-sfer to a new
business of machinery or plaat prcviously used
for any purpose.



Fx —277/2003

4

Explanation,— The provisions of EXplanation 1
and Explanation 2 to sub section (2) of sectin 80-
1 shall apply for the purposes of this clause as
they apply for the purposes of clause (ii) of sub-
secton (2) of that section;

(d) ninety per cent. or more of its
sales during the previous year relevant
to the asse:sment year are by wuy of
exports of the eligible articles or
things;

(e) it employs twenty or more workers
during the previous year in the pro-
cess of manufacture or production.

(3) This section applies to the wundertaking,
if the sale pioceeds of the eligible articles or
things exported out of India are received in
or brought into, India by the assessee in con-
vertible foreign excnange, within a peried ot
six months from the end of the previous year
or, within such further period as the compe-
tent authority may ailow in this behalf.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-
section, the <Xpression “c mpetent authority”
means the Reserve Bauk of India or such oiher
authority as is authorised under any law for
the time being in torce for regulating payments
and dealings 1n toreign exchange.

(4) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the
profits derived from export out of India of
the ecligible arucles or things shall be the
amount which tears to the profits of the bu-
sincss of the undertaking, the same proportion
as the export turnover in respect of sucin arti-
cles or tanings bears to the total turnover of
the business catried on by the undertaking.

(5) The deduction under sub-section (1) shall
not be adunissible, unless the assess.e furni-
shes in the prescribed form, alungwith the
return of incume, the report of an accountant,
as detined in tne Explanation below sub-sec-
tion (.) o1 section 288, certifying that the de-
duction has been correctly claimed in accor-
dance with the provisions oi this section.

(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in any
otaner provision of inis Act, wnere a deduction



52 of 1962.

is allowed under this section in computing the
total income of the assessee, no deduction shall
be allowed under any other section in respect
of its export profits.

(7) The provisions of sub-section (8) and sub-
section (10) of section 80-IA shall, so far as
may be, apply in relation to the undertaking
referred to in this section as they apply for
the purposes of the undertaking referred to
in section 8V-1A.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sec-
tion,—

(@) “convertible foreign exchange”
means forcign eXchange which is for
the time being treated by tBe Reserve
Bank of India as convertible foreign
exchange for the purposes of the Fo-

Ex—

reign Exchange Management Act, 1999, 42 of 1999

and any rules made thereunder or any
other corresponding law for the time
being in force;

(b) “eligible articles or things” means
all hand made articles or things, which
are of artistic value and which requi-
res the use of wood as the main raw
material;

(c) “export turnover” means the consi-
deration in respect of export by the
undertaking of eligible articles or
things received in, or brought into, In-
dia by the assessee in convertible fo-
reign exchange in accordance with sub-
section (3), but does not include freight,
teleccommunication charges or insuran-
ce attributable to the delivery of the
articles or things outside India;

(d) “export out of India” shall not
include any transaction by way of sale
or otherwise, in a shop, emporium or
any other establishment situate in In-
dia, not involving clearance of any cus-
toms station as defined in the Customs
Act, 1962-;



Px=277/2003 - 6

4. In section 115P - of the Income-tax Aci, for the Amend-

words “one and one-fourth per cent.”,the words “one ment of

per cent.” shall be substituted. section
115pP.

Amendment 5. In section 1155 of the Income-tax Aci. tor the
of section words “one znd one-fourth per cent.”, the words “one
115S. per cent.” shall be substituted.

Amendment 6. In secuon 132B of the Income-tax Act ia sub-
of section section (4), in clause (a), fer the words “eivht per
15.B. cent.”, the words “six per cent.” shall be subis:ituted.

Amendment 7. In section 158BFA of th: Income-tax Aci. in sub-
of sectivn section (l), for the woids “one and one-fourth per
158BFA. cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shall be substituted.

Amendment 8. In section 201 of the Income-tax Act, 'n sub-
ot section secton (lA), for the words “fifteen per cent.”, the

201. words “twelve per cent.” shall be substituted.
Amendment 9. In section 206C of the lncome-tax Act, -
of scction :
206C.
(a) in sub-section (1),—
(1) for the table, the following Table shall be
substituted, namely :i—
“TABLE
S1.No. Nature of goods i“ercentage
1 2 3
(i)  Alcoholic Liqﬁbr tor human consumption One jer cent.
(i) Tendu leaves Five per cent. ]
(u) Timber obtained under a forest lease Two and one-half per cent.
(iv) Timber obtained by any mode other Two and one-half per cent.
than under a forest lease '
(v)  Any other forest produce not being Two anc one-half per cent.
timber or tendu leaves
(vi) Scrap Oue per cent.:”;

(i1) tor the proviso betow the Table, the fol-
lowing proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that every person, being a sciizr shall
at the time, duning the period. beginning on the



- 1st day of June, 2003 and ending on the day im-
mediately preceding the date on which the K Taxa-
tion Laws (Amendment) Ordinance, 2003 comes in-
to force, of debiting of the amount payable by

the buyer to the account of the buyer or of re-
ceipt of such amount from the said buyer in cash
or by the issue of a cheque or draft or by any
other mode, whichever is earlier, collect from the
buyer of any goods of the nature specified in co-
lumn (2) of the Table as it stood immediately be-
fore the 1st day of June, 2003, a sum equal to
the percentage, specified in the coresponding entry
in column (3) of the said Table, of such amount
as income-tax in accordance with the provisions
of this section as they stood immediately before

the 1st day of June, 2003.”; o

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-sections
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in
sub-section (1), no collection of tax shall be made
in the case of a buyer, who is resident in India,
if such buyer furnishes to the person responsible
for colleting tax, a declaration in writing in dup-
licate in the prescribed form and verified in the
prescribed manner to the effect that the goods re-
terred to in column (2) of the aforesaid Table are
to be utilsed for the purposes of manufacturing,

rocessing or producing articles or things and not
or trading purposes. c e

(1B) The person responsible for collecting tax
under this section shall deliver or cause to be de-
livered to the Chiet Commissioner or Commis-
sioner one copy of the declaration referred to .in
sub-section (1A) on or before the seventh day of
the month next following the month in which the
declaration is furnished to him.”; :

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven days’,
the words “the prescribed time” shall be substi-
tuted; -

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words “ten days from
the date ot debit”, the words “such period as, may
be prescribed irom the time of debit” shall be
substituted; . - oo

(e) in sub-section (7), for the words “one'and one-
fourth per cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shall
be substituted;



Ex—277/2003 8

(f) in the Explanation occurring at the end, in
clause (a), tor sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the follow-
ing sub-clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

“(i) a public sector company, the Central Go-

vernment a State Government, and an embassy,

a high con.mission, legatio

sulaie and ‘the trade rep:esentation, of a fo-
. reign State and a club, or

(ii) a buyer in the retail sale of such goods
purchased by him for personal cunsumption;”.

1Q. 'In section 220 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
section (2); tor the words “one and one-fourih per
cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shall be substituted.

11. In section 230 of the Income-tax Act, sub-section
%2), atier the words, brackets and figure “sub-section
1)”, the words, brackets, figure and letter ‘or the first
proviso to sub-section (1A)” shali be inserted and shall
be deemed to have been inserted with etfect from the
1st day of June, 2003.

'12. In section 234A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
sections (1) and (3), for the words “one and ore-fourth
per cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shail be substituted.

13. In section 234B of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
sections (1) and (3), for the words “one and one-fourth
per cent.”, the words “one per cent.” spall be sub-
stituted. >

14. In section 234C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
section (1),—

(i) in clause (a), in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), ior the
words “one and one-lourth per cenl.”, the words
“one per cent.” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), in sub-clauses (i) and (i1), ior the
woids “oue and one-tourith per Cent.”, the words
“one per cent.” shall be substiuted.

15. In section 234D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words “two-third per cent.”, the
words “one-half per cent.” shall be substituted.

Amend-
ment of
section
220.

Amend-
ment of
section
230.

Amend-
ment of
secuon
234A.

Amend-
ment of
section
2348.

Amend
ment of
section
234C,

Amend-
ment of
section
234D,



9 Ex—277/2003

16. In section 244A of the Income tax Act, in sub- Amend-
section (1), in ciauses (a) and (b), for the words “two- went of
third per c:nt.”, the words “oue-half per cent.” shall section
be substituted. : 24+A.

17. In section 272A of the lucome tax Act. In sub- Amend- -

section (2), after clause (i), the following clause shall meat of

be inserted, namely: section *
272A.

“(J) to deliver or cause to be delivered in due time
a copy of the deciaration referred to in sub-section
(IA) of section 206C;”.

18. In the Second Schedule to the Inconle-tax Act, Amend-

in rule 68A, in sub-rule (3), for the words “eight per ment of

ceat.”, the words “six per cent.” shall be substituted. Second
Schedule.

CHAPTER Il
AMENDMENTS TO THE WEALTH-TAX ACT, 1957

« 27 of 1957. 19. In section 17B of the Wealth-tax Act, 1957 (here- Amend-
3 inafrer referred to as the Wealth-tax Act), in sub- ment of
sections (1) and (3), for the words “one and one-fourth section
per cent.”, the woids “one per cent.” shall be substi- 17B.
tuted.

Amendment 20. In section 31 of the Wealth-tax Act, in sub-sec-
of section tion (2),—

31.
(a) for the words “onc and one-fourth per cent.”,
the words “one per cent.” shall be substituted,

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “one
and ouse-fouith per cent.”, the words “one per
e cent.” shall be substituted.
Amend- 21. In section 34A of the Wealth-tax Act,—
ment of sec-

tion 34A. (a) in sub-section (3) for the words “eight per
cent.”, the words “six per cent.” shall be substi-
tuted;

(b) in sub-section (4B), clause (a), for the words
“two-third per cent.”, the words “one-half per
cent.” shall be substituted.



Ex—277/2003 10

CHAPTER 1V
AMENDMENT TO THE EXPENDITURE-TAX ACT, 1987

Amendment  22. In section 14 of the Expenditure-tax Act, 1987,
of section 14  for the words “one and onc-fourth per cent.”, the
og Act 35 words “oue per cent.” shall be substituted.

of 1987.

A.P.J. Abdul Kalam,
President.

Subhash C. Jain,
Secy. to the Gevt. of Iadia.

Published and Issued by the Controller, Prinﬁng & Stationery, Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl C- 7(()



