---- _T_he Mlzoram Gazeth
 EXTRA ORDINARY
Published by Authority

t.. . .. REGN NO.NE—313 M2 Rs. 2/- per Issye

Vol“ XXXIII Aizawl, Wednesday, 26.5.2004, Jyaistha 5 S. B 1926’ Issue No. 152

. NOTIFICATION .. ...

No. H. 12017/55/2004-LID/2”, tho 19th May, 2004. . The follomng Central Act
is hercby pubhshnd for general m!‘ermat],ons ST

- Date of assent of the Acts : _' L "= _.23_.'...12.. 2003
_ Date of phbllshcd in Gaz ttc cf Inda L 23. 12,2003

:Sai:ﬁgura Sailo,
Deputy- Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram.

FHE TAXATION LAWS (AMENDMENT) 4CT, 2003
ACT

further tm amsnd tht: Inqm:ne-tax Act, 1961. the Wﬁalth tax Act, 1957 and
the Exyandlturertax Act, }98’1. -

‘BE it cnacted by ‘Parliament _in lhe F:fty-fomth Ycar of the Republic of .
India as folows :—



Ex—152/2004

43 of 1961.

2

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY

f. (1} This Act may be called the Taxation Laws Short title
(Amendment) Act, 2003.

(2) Save as otherwise provided im this Act, it shall be
deemed to have come into force on the 8th day of
September, 2003.

CHAPTER I

AMENDMENTS TO THE INCOME-TAX ACT, 1961.

2.

In section 10 of the Incoms-tax Act, 1961

{hereafter in this Chapter referred to as the Income-
taX Act), m clause (15),— _

(A) after sub-clause (iiia), the following sub-clause
shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been
ingerted with effect from the 1st day of April,
2001, namely:—

“(iitb) interest payable to the Nordic Investment
Bank, being a maltilateral financial institution
coanstituted by the Governments of Denmark,
Finland, Iceland, Norway and Sweden, on a
loan advanced by it to a project approved by
the Central Government in terms of the Me-
morandum of Understanding entered into by
the Central Government with that Bank on the
25th day of November, 1986;";

(B) in sub-clause (iv),—

(a) in item (c), the existing Explanation shall
be numbered as Explanation 1 thereof and after
Explapantion 1 as so numbered, the following
Explanation shail be inserted and shall. be
deemed to have been inserted with effect from
the 1st day of April, 1962, namely: —

““Explanation 2.—For the removai of poubts, it
is hereby declared that the usance intercst pay-
able cutside India by an undertaking engaged
in the business of ship-breaking in respect of
purchase of a ship from outside India shall be
deemed to be the interest payable on a debt
incurred in a foreign country in respect of the
purchase outside India;”; - o

and com-
mencament.

Amend-
ment of
section 10,



2 Ex—152/2004

(b) in the Explanation | occurring below item
(i), after clause (d), the following. clause shall
be inserted and shall be deemed to have been
inserted with effect from the ist day of April,
1991, namely:— _ '

“(da) the business of ship-breaking; or”.
Tnsertion 3. After section 0B of the Income-tax Act, the follo?

of new sec-  wing section shall be inserted with effect from the st
tion 10BA. day of April, 2004, namely: —

Special ‘10BA. (1) Subject to the provisions of this section,
Provisions a deduyction of such profits and gains as are de-
1n respect rived by an undertaking from the export out of
of exportt India of eligible articles or things, shall be allowed
of certain from the total income of the assesgee:

articles or ' '

things. Provided that where in computing the total in-

come of the undertaking for any assessment year,
deduction under section 10A or section 10B has
been ciaimed, the undertaking shall not be entitled
to the deduction under this section: '

Provided further that no deduction under this
section shall be allowed to any undertaking for the
assessment year beginnimg on the 1st day of April,
2010 and subsequent years. :

(2) This section applies to any undertaking which
fulfils the following conditions, namely:—

(a) it manufactures or produces the oligible
articles or things without the use of imported
raw malerials; '

| (b) it is not formed by the .Splittiiii' up, or
-the reconstruction, of a business already in
existence: - '

_ Provided that this condition shall pot apply
in respect of any undertaking which is foermed
as a result of the re-establishment, reconstryction
or revival by the assessee of the business of
any such undertaking as is referred to in sec-
tion 33B, in the circumstances and within the
period specified in rhat section; - '

(c) it is not formed by the transfer to a'- new
business of machinery or plant previousty used
for any purpose. o o



o

Ex—152/2004

4

.. .Explanation..——The provisions of Explapation t
;_‘aq% Explanation 2 to sub-section (3) of section
80-1 shall apply for the pufposes of this clause
as they apply for the purposes of clause (i)

. ef .sub-section 12) .of that section;

. (d)___;n_lingit-_\c_ per _cant. or wore of its sales du-
fing the previons year relevant to the assess-
ment year are by way of exports of the elipible

~artticles or things;

(e) it employs . twenty or rmore workers du-
ting the previous year in the process of manu-
facture or production. ' '

" (3) This section applies to the undertaking, if the

sale praceeds of the eligible arti¢les or things ex-:
ported out of Irdid are received i or trought in-
to, India by the assessee i convertible foreign ex-
change, within a period of six months from the
end of the previous year or, within such further

. ..period as the compeient authority may allow in

this behalf.

. Explanation.— For the purposes of this sub-sec-

tion, the expression “competent authority”, meauns
the Reserve Barik of India or such other authornty

‘as is_authorised under any law for the time ieing

in force for regulating payments and dealings in
foreign exchange. ' _—

(4) For the purposes of sub-sectien. (1), the pro--

fits derived from exgo_rt out of India of the eligible
a

articles oc things shall be the amount which bears
to the profits of the business of the undertaking,
the same proportion as the export turnover in res-

- pect of such articles or things bears to the total

turnover of the business carried on by tie under-
taking. . . o

' (S)Thx deduction ‘undér sub-section (1) shall not.

be admissible, unless the assessee furnishes in the:
prescribed form, along with the return of income,
the report of an accountant, as defined in the Ex-
pnlanation below sub-section (2) of secrion 238, cer--
tifving that the deduction has beer correctly clai
ined m accordance with the provisions of this sec-
ton.



5 Ex—152/2004

' (6) Notwithstanding anything contained: in amy - -~ - *
~ other provision of this Act, where a deduction is SRR
allowed under this section in computing the'total
income of the assessce, no deduction shall be al-
lowed under any other section in respect of its ex-
jort profits, Co o

(Y The vrovisions of sub-section (8) and sub-
section (i0) of section 30 IA shall, so far as may
‘be, apply in relation to the undertaking reterred -
to i this section =5 they apnly for the purposcs
of the undertaking referred to in section - 80-1A.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) “convertible foreign exchange” means fo-
rc:}n exchange which is for the time being trea-
ted by the Reserve Bank of "India as converti-
ble foreign exchange for the purposes of the
Foreign Exchange Management Act, 1999,
42 of 1999. and any rules made-thereunder or any other
corresponding law {or the time being 1n force;

(b) “eligible articles or things” means all hand-
made articles or things, which are of artistic
value and which requires the use of wood as
the main raw material;

(c)’ “export turnover” means the consideration:

in' respect of export by the undertaking' of eli-
gible articles or things received in; or brought -
mmto, India by the assessee in convertible foreign
exchange in accordance with sub-section (3),

but does not include freight, telecommunication -

- charges or insurance attributable to the deli- - -
very of the articles or things outside India;

(d) “export out of India” shall not include any
transaction by way of sale or otherwise, in a
shop, emporium or any other establishment si-
tuate in India, not involving clearance of any

52 of 1962. : customs station as defined in the Customs
Act, 1962.° : SR

Amendment ‘4. In section '115P of the. Ilicome-tax Act, for the
of section 115P words “one ' and one-fourth per cent.”, the . words
 “ome per cent,” shall be substituted.. . .. -

Amendment of 5. In section 1158 of the Inceme-tax.Act, for the
section 1158~ words “one and ome-fourth per ceat,” the words
“one per cent,” shall be substituted.



Ex—152{2004 6

Amendment of 6. In section 132B of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
section 132B section (4), in clause (a), for the words “eight per
cont,” the words “six per cent” shall be substituted.

Awmendment of 7. In section 158BFA of the Income-tax Act, in

section 158BFA sub-section (1), for the words “one and one-fourth
per cent,” the words “ome pcr cent;” shall be sub-
stituted.

Amendment of 8. In section 201 of the Ilncome-tax Act, in sub-
section 201 section (1A) for the words “fifteen per cent”, the
words “twelve per cent” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 9. Im section 206C of the Income-tax Act,-

section 206C .
(8) in sub-section (1),-
(i) for the Table, the following Table shall
he substituted, namely:-
“TABLE

Sl.No. Nature of goods R Percentage
¢4 (2) (3
(i)  Alcoholic liquor for human consuymption One per cent.
(it) Tendu leaves Five per cent )
(#ii} Timber oblained under a forest lease Two and one-half per cent.

(iv) Timber obtajned by any moede other than  Two and one-half per cent.
under a forest lease
(v}  Any other ferest produce not being timber  Two and one half per cent.
_ or tendu leaves
{vi} Scrap One per cent.:”;

(ii) for the proviso below the Table, the [oliowing
proviso shall be substituted, namely: —

“Provided that every person, being a seller
shall at the time, during the period beginning on
the 1st day of Jume, 2003 and ending on the day
immediately preceding the date on which the Tax-
ation Laws (Amendment) Act, 2003 comes into
force, of decbiting of the amount pavable by the
buyer to the account of the buyer or of receipt
of such amount from the said buyer in cash or by
the issue of a cheque or draft or by anv other
mods, whichcver is earlier, collect from the buyer
of any goods of the mnature specified in column



7 Ex—152/2004

{2) of the Table as it stood immediately before the
Ist day of Jyge, 2003, a sum equal to the percen—
tage, specified in the correspoading eptry in column
(3) of the said Table, of sych amouyns ?s income-
tax in accordance with the provisions of this sec-
tion as they stood immediately before the Ist day
of June, 2003.7;

{b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-sec-
tians shall be inserted, gamely :- '

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-
section (1), no collection of tax shall be made in
ths case of a buyer, who is resident ip Indla, if
such buyer furnishes ta the pergon responsible for
¢collecting ax, a deciaratipn i vmt;gg 12 dyplicate
in the preseribed form and verified in the pres-
cribed manner to the effect that the goods referred
to in column (2) of the aforesaid Table are to be

ytilised for the purposes of manufacturing, procss-

sing or producing articles or thiogs and not for

trading purpeses.

(1B) The person respogsible for collecting tax
yader this section shall deliver or capse to be
delivered to the Chief Commissioper or Com-
missioner one copy of the declaration referred
to in sub-section (1A) on or before the seventh
day of the month pext following the monthin
which the declaration is furn-ish%d'to him.”;

{c) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven days”,
the words *‘the prescribed time” shall be sub-
stituted;

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words “ten days
from the date of debit”, the words “such period
as may be prescribed from the time of debit” shall
be substitated; '

{e) in sub-section (7), for the words *“one and one
fourth per cent.”, the words ‘“one per cent.” shall
be substituted; '

(f) in the Explanation occurring at the end, in
clause (a), for sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the following
-sub-clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

“(i) a public sector company, the Central Go-
vernment, a State Government, and an embassy,



E3-—152/2004 8

a high commission, Jegation, commission,
. consulate and the trade representation, of a
~ torgign State and a club; or '

(i) a buver in the retail sale of such goads
nurchased by him for personal consumptron;.

10. In section 220 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-sec-
tion (2}, tor the words “one and one-fourth per cent.”,
the words “one per cent.” shall be substituted.

11. 'In section 230 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-sec-
tion (2), after the word, brackets and figure ‘sub-sec-
tion (1)”, the words, brackets, figure and letter “or
the first proviso to sub-section (1A)” shall be inserted
and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect
from the 1st day of June, 2003. -

12. In section '234A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-sec-
tions (1) and (3), for the words *“one and one-fourth
pefeé:ent.”, the words ‘““one per cent.” shall - be substi-
tuted.

13. In section 234B of the ' Income-tax Act, in sub-
sections (1) and (3), for the words “one and one-fourth
per cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shall be substi-
tuted. ' a ' '

14." In section 234C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
section (1),— '

(i) in clause (a} in sub-clauses (i) and (i), for
the weords “one and one-fourth per cent.” il vwords
“omne per cent.” shall be substituted;

,'_"(ii) in clause (b), in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for the
words “one and one-fourth per cent.”, the words
*‘one per cent.” shall be substituted.

15. In section 234D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-sec-
tion (1), for the words “two-third per cent.”, the words
“one-half per cent. shafl be substituted.

16. In section 244A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-
se¢tion {1}, in clauses {a) and (b), for the words “two
-third per cent.”, the words “one-bal( per cent.” shall
be substituted. '

Amend-
ment of
section 220.

Amend-
ment of
section 230.

Amend-
ment of
section
234A.

Awmend-
ment of
section -~
234B.

Amepd-
ment of
secticn
234C.

Amend-
ment of
section
234D



0 Ex-—152/2004

17. 1In section 2724 of the Income tax Act. in sub-
section (2), after clause (i), the tollowing claus: shall
be inserted, namely: —

“(j) to deliver or cause to be delivered in due time
a copy of the declaration referred to in sub-section
(1A) of section 206C,”.

18. In the Second Schedule to the Income-tax Act, in
rule 68A, in sub-rule (3), tor the worls “eizht per
cent.”, the words “six per cent.” shall be subs:ituted.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE WEALTH-TAX ACT, 1957

Amendment 19. In Section 17B of the Wealth-tax Act, 1657

of section (hereafter in this Chapter referred to as the Wealith—-

17B. Tax Act), in sub-sections (1) and (3), for the words

- “one and one-fourth rercent.”, the words “one per
cent.” shall be substituted.

An;endment 20. In section 31 of the Wealth-tax Act, it sub-sec-
of section tion (2),~—
31.

(a) for the words “one and one-fourth per cent.”,
the words “one per cent.” shall be subsiituted;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “one
and one-fourth per cent.”, the words “vne per
cent.” shall be substituted.

Amendment 21. In section 34A of the Wealth~tax Act,—
of section

34A. (a) in sub-section (3), for the words “ecight per
cent.”, the words “six per cent.” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4B), in clause (3), for thz
words “two-third per cent.” the words “one-half
per cent.” shall be substituted.

Amend-
ment of
272A.

Amend-
ment

of Second
Schedule.

7 of 1957,

[ ]



Ex—152/2004 0

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO TH:Z ZXPENDITURE-TAX ACT, 1987

Amendment 22. Ip section 14 of the Expenditure-tax Act, 1987,
of section for the words “one and one fourth rer ceul.”, the
14 of Act 35  words “one per cent.” shall be substituted.

of 1987.

Repeal and 23. (1) The Taxation Laws {(Amendment) Crdinance,
saving. 2003 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithsianding such repeal, anything dene or
any action iaken under the Income-tax Act, 1961,
the Wealth-tsx Act, 1957 and the Lxpen liture—
tax Act, 1987, as amended by the said O:dinrance,
shall be deemed to have been done or taken under
the corresponding provisions of thosc Acts, as
amended by this Act.

Ord. 2 of
2003.

43 of 1961
27 of 1957
35 of 1987

Publisked and Issued ‘B; the bor-twller _-I-‘rinti}j; & 'St;atjf_::f;-ér:;;_,"Mizoram

Printed at the Mizoram Government Press. Aizawl ¢ --700



